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The following information regarding 
mandatory bars and how they manage 
Keller related activities was compiled 
by State Bar of Michigan between 
February 2014 and May 2014. This 
was a significant research initiative to 
support the Michigan Supreme Court 
Task Force on the Role of the State 
Bar of Michigan. As information 
was gathered, executive directors 
from several state bars expressed an 
interest in receiving this compilation 
of material. We are pleased to share 
this information with those who find 
it useful. Please note that the State 
Bar of Michigan does not update this 
compilation as policies and statutes 
change in various states. Users are 
encouraged to check with the state 
bars directly to learn of any relevant 
changes.

Mandatory State Bar Associations

Managing Keller



 
• Louisiana 

o Bylaws 
o LSBA House of Delegates info 
o House of Delegates rules of procedures 

  














































